PURDUE UNIVERSITY TABULATION OF BIDSFOR SEPTEMBER 24, 2009

SCHNEIDER AVENUE BUILDING RENOVATION —WEST WING OFFICES - 2009

PURDUE UNIVERSITY CALUMET CAMPUS

Superior Design-Build, LLC Gariup Construction Company, The Pangere Corporation Hasse Construction Co., Inc. CMM Group, Inc. Of lllinois
BIDDERS e
Hammond, IN Gary, IN Gary, IN Calumet City, IL Lansing, IL
COMPLETE CONSTRUCTION
Base Bid $572,000.00 $490,700.00 $548,739.00 $516,000.00 $649,700.00

Alternate No. 1 Add/Deduct +9,700.00 10,000.00 +8,000.00 +9,500.00 +11,000.00
Alternate No. 2 Add/Deduct +11,300.00 11,000.00 +1,000.00 +11,400.00 +11,000.00
Alternate No. 3 Add/Deduct +6,000.00 7,200.00 +5,500.00 +14,000.00 +7,200.00
Alternate No. 4 Add/Deduct +1,325.00 2,900.00 +500.00 +5,200.00 No Bid
Alternate No. 5 Add/Deduct +2,375.00 4,100.00 +4,000.00 +4,150.00 +4,200.00
Alternate No. 6 Add/Deduct +16,600.00 19,000.00 +18,000.00 +16,200.00 +19,400.00
Alternate No. 7 Add/Deduct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate No. 1 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new gypsum board partition with vinyl base and corner guard and new door frame and hardware at Opening No. 108.

Alternate No
Alternate No

. 2 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new card reader at Door Opening No. 108; add new card reader No. 028 and add Badge Reader at Door Opening No. 309.
. 3 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new janitor sink and related plumbing and install exhaust fan EF-1 and associated electrical.
Alternate No. 4 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add PUC wall mounted Logo-Acrylic Glass with brushed aluminum standoffs.

Alternate No. 5 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install new ductwork and associated reheat coils RHC-2.
Alternate No. 6 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install supply main in future energy lab and associated take offs. Install supply mainin existing corridor 1017. Install supply
ductwork and associated reheat coil RHC-3 in corridor GHOL. Install ductwork and associated reheat coil RHC-7 for room G007 and GOO08.
Alternate No. 7 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install electrical panels GHEL, GLE1, GHLS1 and GLL S1, associated transformers GTEL and GTLS1 and conduit.




PURDUE UNIVERSITY TABULATION OF BIDSFOR SEPTEMBER 24, 2009

SCHNEIDER AVENUE BUILDING RENOVATION —WEST WING OFFICES - 2009

PURDUE UNIVERSITY CALUMET CAMPUS

Tonn and Blank Construction,
A Division of Alverno

Larson-Danielson Construction
Co,, Inc.

Gough, Inc.

Gibson-Lewis, LLC

Barton Malow Company

BIDDERS Construction Company, LLC
Hammond, IN LaPorte, IN Merrillville, IN Mishawaka, IN Chicago, IL
COMPLETE CONSTRUCTION

Base Bid $518,600.00 $568,047.00 $539,950.00 $564,800.00 $549,600.00
Alternate No. 1 Add/Deduct 8,000.00 10,943.00 +9,700.00 +9,600.00 +17,000.00
Alternate No. 2 Add/Deduct No Bid 1,720.00 +11,400.00 +920.00 +11,200.00
Alternate No. 3 Add/Deduct 5,250.00 5,771.00 +6,750.00 +5,500.00 +4,300.00
Alternate No. 4 Add/Deduct 2,200.00 3,904.00 +2,300.00 +7,000.00 +3,400.00
Alternate No. 5 Add/Deduct 4,000.00 4,026.00 +4,100.00 +2,250.00 +2,300.00
Alternate No. 6 Add/Deduct 18,500.00 18,180.00 +19,200.00 +15,700.00 +15,800.00
Alternate No. 7 Add/Deduct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate No. 1 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new gypsum board partition with vinyl base and corner guard and new door frame and hardware at Opening No. 108.

Alternate No
Alternate No

Alternate No. 4 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add PUC wall mounted Logo-Acrylic Glass with brushed aluminum standoffs.
Alternate No. 5 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install new ductwork and associated reheat coils RHC-2.
Alternate No. 6 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install supply main in future energy lab and associated take offs. Install supply mainin existing corridor 1017. Install supply
ductwork and associated reheat coil RHC-3 in corridor GHOL. Install ductwork and associated reheat coil RHC-7 for room G007 and GOO08.
Alternate No. 7 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install electrical panels GHEL, GLE1, GHLS1 and GLL S1, associated transformers GTEL and GTLS1 and conduit.

. 2 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new card reader at Door Opening No. 108; add new card reader No. 028 and add Badge Reader at Door Opening No. 309.
. 3 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new janitor sink and related plumbing and install exhaust fan EF-1 and associated electrical.




PURDUE UNIVERSITY TABULATION OF BIDSFOR SEPTEMBER 24, 2009

SCHNEIDER AVENUE BUILDING RENOVATION —WEST WING OFFICES - 2009

PURDUE UNIVERSITY CALUMET CAMPUS

Poulos, Inc. Gil Behling and Son, Inc. George Allen Construction Co. Berglund Construction Joseph J. Duffy Co., Inc.
Company
BIDDERS
Chicago, IL Hammond, IN Mokena, IL Chesterton, IN Chicago, IL
COMPLETE CONSTRUCTION
Base Bid $626,000.00 $612,000.00 $594,700.00 $557,000.00 $571,557.00
Alternate No. 1 Add/Deduct +10,000.00 +13,560.00 9,250.00 +9,300.00 11,087.00
Alternate No. 2 Add/Deduct +1,000.00 +15,000.00 11,400.00 +11,000.00 391.00
Alternate No. 3 Add/Deduct +7,000.00 +6,700.00 7,400.00 +6,500.00 10,120.00
Alternate No. 4 Add/Deduct +3,000.00 No Bid 2,900.00 +3,300.00 No Bid
Alternate No. 5 Add/Deduct +4,500.00 +2,500.00 4,200.00 +5,200.00 4,370.00
Alternate No. 6 Add/Deduct 19,000.00 +16,900.00 19,700.00 +25,000.00 20,240.00
Alternate No. 7 Add/Deduct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Alternate No. 1 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new gypsum board partition with vinyl base and corner guard and

new door frame and hardware at Opening No. 108.

Alternate No. 2 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new card reader at Door Opening No. 108; add new card reader No. 028 and add Badge Reader at Door Opening No. 309.
Alternate No. 3 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add new janitor sink and related plumbing and install exhaust fan EF-1 and associated electrical.
Alternate No. 4 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to add PUC wall mounted Logo-Acrylic Glass with brushed aluminum standoffs.
Alternate No. 5 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install new ductwork and associated reheat coils RHC-2.
Alternate No. 6 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install supply main in future energy lab and associated take offs. Install supply mainin existing corridor 1017. Install supply

ductwork and associated reheat coil RHC-3 in corridor GHOL. Install ductwork and associated reheat coil RHC-7 for room G007 and GOO08.

Alternate No. 7 - State the amount to be added to the Base Bid to install electrical panels GHEL, GLE1, GHLS1 and GLL S1, associated transformers GTEL and GTLS1 and conduit.




